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ANTARES VISION: COMPLETION OF ACQUISITION OF ADENTS' ASSETS 

 
Expansion of portfolio of software solutions and cloud services for end-to-end traceability 

and strengthening of the Group's international presence 
 

Travagliato (BS), February 24, 2021 – Antares Vision announces that today it has completed the 
acquisition of the assets of the French company Adents High Tech International ("Adents"), for 
which Antares Vision was the successful bidder in the context of the Adents liquidation procedure, 
as previously disclosed to the market on November 12, 2020.   
 
The value of the transaction, amounting to euro 1.5 million and paid as a deposit on November 12, 
2020, was released today simultaneously with the signing of the contract. 
 
The software platform for the management and exchange of data between companies and 
regulators (level 5) and the software for the provision of cloud services (both single-tenant and multi-
tenant) developed by Adents and today acquired by Antares Vision will allow Antares Vision to 
expand its portfolio of software solutions capable of track and trace the entire supply chain end-
to-end. 
 
The Group is also strengthening its R&D team with the addition of 17 highly specialised resources 
to its workforce, until today. At the same time, the Group will further strengthen its service capacity 
with more extensive coverage in technical and sales support, as well as its international presence, 
mainly in France, England, Ireland, Sweden and the United States. 
 
The transaction does not qualify as significant pursuant to Article 12 of the AIM Issuers’ Regulation, 
since none of the applicable significance ratios exceeds 25%. 
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About Antares Vision 

Listed since April 2019 on the AIM Italia market of the Italian Stock Exchange, Antares Vision Group 
guarantees the protection of products, people and brands through inspection systems for quality 
control, Track & Trace solutions for anti-counterfeiting and supply chain transparency, smart data 
management tools for maximized efficiency and digitalization of the supply chain, from the point of 
production to the end consumer. The Antares Vision Group is active in the life science sector, 
including the pharmaceutical, medical device and hospital segments, as well as in other industries, 
including, primarily, food & beverage, cosmetics and in consumer-packaged goods. The Group 
reaches over 60 countries worldwide with complete and flexible solutions, hardware and software, 
with related services: it has five offices in Italy (Brescia, Parma, Piacenza, Latina and Vicenza), 15 
foreign branches (Germany [2], France [2], USA [3], Latin America [2], India, Russia, Hong Kong, China, 
Croatia and Serbia), three Innovation and Research Centers (Italy) and a worldwide network of more 
than 40 partners. With the twenty years of experience in vision technologies of the two founding 
partners, the Antares Vision Group is the supplier of ten of the 20 leading pharmaceutical companies 
in the world (by turnover), with more than 25,000 inspection systems, which ensure everyday product 
safety and quality, 6,500 quality controls and more than 3,500 serialization modules on lines installed 
all over the world. With the aim of continuing and supporting the growth and development strategy, 
during 2019, Antares Vision finalized participation agreements with T2 Software, a Brazilian 
company specialized in smart data management solutions, and Orobix, an Italian company leader in 
artificial intelligence services, and acquired 100% of FT System, leader in control and inspection in 
the beverage sector. In 2020, Antares Vision acquired 82.83% of Tradeticity, a Croatian company 
specialized in software management of traceability and serialization processes, 100% of Convel, an 
Italian company specialized in automated inspection machines for the pharmaceutical industry, the 
assets of Adents High Tech International, a French company specialized in software for serialization 
and traceability, and 100% of Applied Vision, a global leader in inspection systems for glass and 
metal containers in food & beverage; in 2021 it reached an agreement for the acquisition of 100% of 
rfXcel Corporation, a leading US-based "SaaS" company serving the Life Science and Food & 
Beverage sectors. In 2019, Emidio Zorzella and Massimo Bonardi won the Ernst & Young 
“Entrepreneur of the Year” award for innovation. For more info: www.antaresvision.com.  
 

http://www.antaresvision.com/

